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No one expected this journey. Jessica Carmel was born with a severe congenital heart condition. At four days
old, her parents learned she would need heart surgery. They had no idea that her future held multiple
surgeries and even more unexpected challenges. Fast-forward sixteen years. As Jessica sat in her
cardiologist’s office for a routine checkup, he told her and her mom that there was nothing more he could do
for her. Jessica needed a heart transplant. Three weeks later, Jessica underwent heart transplant surgery. Her
recovery was long, but good. Feeling healthier than ever, she went on to graduate high school and college.
Soon after her college graduation,however, she began to feel “off.” She visited the emergency room for what
she thought was severe stomach pain, but it turned out her heart was the real issue. She was admitted to the
hospital to relieve fluid, and a couple of days into her stay, a transplant nephrologist informed her she was
going to need a kidney transplant. Nearly ten years had passed since Jessica had received her heart
transplant, and now she was in desperate need for a kidney. Her only hope to survive was her hero and sister,
Amy. Amy came through—right away, she agreed to offer up one of her kidneys. Now, it wasn’t enough that
Jessica’s mom was going to see one daughter off to the operating room, as she had done with Jessica many
times before. She would be seeing both her daughters heading into surgery. In The Hearts of a Girl, Jessica
shares that story and the story of her many years of struggle to survive and thrive after a long history of
challenging surgeries. It’s a story that informs and inspires.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Kelly:

The experience that you get from The Hearts of a Girl: The Journey Through Congenital Heart Disease and
Heart Transplant is a more deep you excavating the information that hide inside words the more you get
interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but The Hearts of a Girl: The
Journey Through Congenital Heart Disease and Heart Transplant giving you buzz feeling of reading. The
copy writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the
item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this The Hearts of a Girl: The Journey Through Congenital Heart
Disease and Heart Transplant instantly.

Pat Clark:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along with soon.
The The Hearts of a Girl: The Journey Through Congenital Heart Disease and Heart Transplant will give you
new experience in examining a book.

Walter Feuerstein:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book The Hearts of a Girl: The Journey Through Congenital Heart Disease and Heart
Transplant was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science
competence. Some people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit from a
book, you can experience enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you
just wanted.

Cinthia Jacobsen:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just in search of the The Hearts of a Girl: The Journey Through Congenital Heart Disease and
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