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Some days you should just stay in bed...

Honeydew Morning-Sun Sullivan is having a bad day. Apart from having absentee hippie parents, a job in
crisis management that she hates, and an apartment she can’t afford, Honey is about to learn there are some
mornings you should just call in sick.

First, she gets fired. Then, while wandering the streets of D.C. in a jobless stupor, she accidentally enters a
deserted neighborhood that happens to be a portal to another dimension.

Whoops.

When Honey wakes up in a world with blue grass that feels like the finest strands of silk and a sky the color
of amethysts, she knows something weird is going on. But it’s when the enormous warriors who look
uncannily like living Easter Island statues riding leopard-spotted Clydesdales show up that she really starts to
panic.

Trapped in a world that seems like a cross between Aladdin and Victorian England, with a resentful
populace, a shaky monarchy, and a villain who looks like Jafar’s evil cousin, Honey is thrust into the middle
of a struggle for the crown, even as a hidden enemy tries to take her out of the equation.

Developing abilities she never dreamed of back home and friendships she can’t live without, Honey must use
her wits and her questionable PR skills to maneuver a treacherous royal court, assassination attempts, an
unexpected mating with an immortal fire creature who really likes using the word “MINE,” and to help a
young, orphaned king unite a fragile realm.

Can't a girl catch a break?
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From reader reviews:

Evan Hinson:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Woman of Silk and Stone (Lost in Edin, Book 1).
You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a
new book Woman of Silk and Stone (Lost in Edin, Book 1). You can add information and of course you can
around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize everything!
From your country until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple point until wonderful
thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called
e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Geraldine Moreno:

You can get this Woman of Silk and Stone (Lost in Edin, Book 1) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this
reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by means of e-
book. In the modern era like now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Margaret Cardwell:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Woman of Silk and Stone (Lost in Edin, Book 1)
was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Woman of Silk and Stone (Lost
in Edin, Book 1) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Private investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of
book usually are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book
in your case and try to like reading that.

David Packard:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this Woman of Silk and
Stone (Lost in Edin, Book 1).
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