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Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation is a proceeding of the 2008
Grover Conference (Lost Valley Ranch and Conference Center, Sedalia, Colorado; September 3-7, 2008),
which provided a forum for experts in the fields of those receptors, channels and transporters that have been
identified as playing key roles in the physiology and pathophysiology of the pulmonary circulation. The
book rigorously addresses: i) recent advances in our knowledge of receptors, channels and transporters and
their role in regulation of pulmonary vascular function; ii) how modulation of expression and function of
receptors, channels and transporters and their interrelationships contribute to the pathogenesis of pulmonary
vascular disease; and iii) the therapeutic opportunities that may be revealed by enhancing our understanding
of this area. The overall goal was to explore the mechanisms by which specific receptors, channels and
transporters contribute to pulmonary vascular function in both health and disease, and how this knowledge
may lead to novel interventions in lung dysplasia, pulmonary edema, lung injury, and pulmonary and
systemic hypertension to reduce and prevent death from lung disease. Membrane Receptors, Channels and
Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation is divided into six parts. Part 1 (Ion Channels in the Pulmonary
Vasculature: Basics and New Findings) is designated for basic knowledge and recent findings in the research
field of ion channels in pulmonary circulation. There are five chapters in Part I discussing the function,
expression, distribution and regulation of various ion channels present in pulmonary vascular smooth muscle
cells and how these channels are integrated to regulate intracellular Ca2+ and cell functions. Part II (TRP
Channels in the Pulmonary Vasculature: Basics and New Findings) is composed of five chapters that are
exclusively designed to discuss the role of a recently identified family of cation channels, transient receptor
potential (TRP) channels, in the regulation of pulmonary vascular tone and arterial structure. Part III
(Pathogenic Role of Ion Channels in Pulmonary Vascular Disease) includes four chapters that discuss how
abnormal function and expression of various ion channels contribute to changes in cell functions and the
development of pulmonary hypertension. Part IV (Receptors and Signaling Cascades in Pulmonary Arterial
Hypertension) consists of five chapters devoted to the role of bone morphogenetic protein receptors, Notch
receptors, serotonin receptors, Rho kinase and vascular endothelial growth factor receptors in the
development of pulmonary arterial hypertension. Part V (Receptors and Transporters: Role in Cell Function
and Hypoxic Pulmonary Vasoconstriction) includes four chapters designed to illustrate the potential
mechanisms involved in oxygen sensing and hypoxia-induced pulmonary vasoconstriction and hypertension.
Part VI (Targeting Ion Channels and Membrane Receptors in Developing Novel Therapeutic Approaches for
Pulmonary Vascular Disease) consists five chapters which discuss the translational research involving on
membrane receptors, channels and transporters, including their potential as novel drug targets. We hope that
Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation will allow readers to foster new
concepts and new collaborations and cooperations among investigators so as to further understand the role of
receptors, channels and transporters in lung pathophysiology. The ultimate goal is to identify new
mechanisms of disease, as well as new therapeutic targets for pulmonary vascular diseases. An additional
outcome should be enhanced understanding of the role of these entities in systemic vascular
pathophysiology, since the conference will include researchers and clinicians with interests in both
pulmonary and systemic circulations.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Wirth:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters
in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology). You can choose the best book
if you want reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book Membrane Receptors,
Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology).
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, mainly
because from book you can realize everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a
book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go
to the library. Let's learn.

Donald Hamann:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Membrane Receptors, Channels and
Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology). All type of book
would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Tanya Minor:

This Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental
Medicine and Biology) are usually reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
explanation of this Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in
Experimental Medicine and Biology) can be one of many great books you must have will be giving you
more than just simple reading through food but feed you actually with information that probably will shock
your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Membrane Receptors, Channels and
Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology) forcing you to
have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that could it
useful in your day action. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Edward Carter:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Membrane Receptors, Channels and
Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation (Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology) reserve written by
well-known writer who knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who read the
book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your hunger



then you still question Membrane Receptors, Channels and Transporters in Pulmonary Circulation
(Advances in Experimental Medicine and Biology) as good book not just by the cover but also by content.
This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by its handle, so do you still needing yet another sixth
sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to one more sixth sense.
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